
RESOLUTION

RE:APPROVEAMENDMENT#1TO INTERGOVERNMENTALAGREEMENTFOR
CONSTRUCTIONOFIMPROVEMENTSTO"O"STREETAND59THAVENUE
INTERSECTIONANDAUTHORIZECHAIRTOSIGN-CITYOFGREELEY

WHEREAS,theBoardofCountyCommissionersofWeldCounty,Colorado,pursuantto
ColoradostatuteandtheWeldCountyHomeRuleCharter,isvestedwiththeauthorityof
administeringtheaffairsofWeldCounty,Colorado,and

WHEREAS,theBoardhasbeenpresentedwithAmendment#1totheIntergovernmental
AgreementfortheConstructionofImprovementstothe"O"Streetand59thAvenueIntersection
betweentheCountyofWeld,StateofColorado,byandthroughtheBoardofCounty
CommissionersofWeldCounty,onbehalfoftheDepartmentofPublicWorks,andtheCityof
Greeley,commencingAugust25,2021,andendingDecember31,2025,withfurthertermsand
conditionsbeingasstatedinsaidamendment,and

WHEREAS,afterreview,theBoarddeemsitadvisabletoapprovesaidamendment,a
copyofwhichisattachedheretoandincorporatedhereinbyreference.

NOW,THEREFORE,BEITRESOLVEDbytheBoardofCountyCommissionersof
WeldCounty,Colorado,thatAmendment#1totheIntergovernmentalAgreementforthe
ConstructionofImprovementstothe"O"Streetand59thAvenueIntersectionbetweentheCounty
ofWeld,StateofColorado,byandthroughtheBoardofCountyCommissionersofWeldCounty,
onbehalfoftheDepartmentofPublicWorks,andtheCityofGreeley,be,andherebyis,approved.

BEITFURTHERRESOLVEDbytheBoardthattheChairbe,andherebyis,authorized
tosignsaidamendment.

TheaboveandforegoingResolutionwas,onmotiondulymadeandseconded,adopted
bythefollowingvoteonthe16thdayofAugust,A.D.,2023,nuncprotuncAugust25,2021.

BOARDOFCOUNTYCOMMISSIONERS
WELDCOUNTY,COLORADO

ATTEST:
MikeFreeman,Chair

WeldCountyClerktotheBoard

PerryL.Buck,Pro-Tem
BY:

DeputyClerktotheBoard
ScottK.James

APPROVEDASTOFORM:
KevinD.Ross

CountyAttorney
LoriSaine

Dateofsignature:
2023-2415
EG0081



ContracM#ER

BOARDOFCOUNTYCOMMISSIONERS
PASS-AROUNDREVIEW

PASS-AROUNDTITLE:CityofGreeleyAmendedIGA-59*Avenue&OStreetRAB

DEPARTMENT:PublicWorks . DATE:7/25/23

PERSONREQUESTING:ElizabethRelford

Briefdescriptionoftheproblem/issue:
OnAugust25,2021,WeldCountyandtheCityofGreeleyexecutedanIGAtoshareinthecostfora
roundabout(RAB)projectattheintersectionof595Avenue(CR31)andOStreet(CR64).Thedeadlineinthe
originalIGAwasforconstructiontobecompletedbyDecember31,2023.

GreeleyhasrequestedamendingtheagreementdeadlinetoDecember31,2025,tobetteralignwiththeir
currentconstructionschedule.Also,theamendedIGAisaddinganewcomponenttoincludethemilland
overlaycostshareof595AvenuefromtheintersectionimprovementstoSH392.Thetwocommunitiesshare
jurisdictionofthecorridorandhavingonecontractorsimultaneouslyperformtheworkforbothagencieswillbe
moreefficientforthetravelingpublic.
Therefore,theRABprojectcostcontributionof$1,669,565remainsthesame.GreeleyandWeldCountyagree
tosharethemillandoverlaycost(50/50)for595Avenue.PublicWorkshasthebudgettocoverthiscost.By
contractingthework,itallowsthepavementmanagementdivisiontocontinueworkingonthemaintenanceof
othercountyroads.

GreeleyhashiredJREngineeringandisintheprocessofdesigningtheRAB.GreeleyreceivedSurface
TransportationandBlockGrant(STBG)fundingfromtheNFRMPOtoassistwiththeprojectconstructioncosts
andisresponsibleforProjectManagingthecontractorandalltheconstruction.
WhatoptionsexistfortheBoard?(includeconsequences,impacts,costs,etc.ofoptions):
1.ApprovaltoputtheIGAontheBoardsagendaforconsideration.
2.ScheduleaworksessiontofurtherdiscusstheIGA.

Recommendation:
Staffrecommendsoption1.

SupportBOCC Schedule
AaendApprovalWorkSessionOther/Comments:

PerryL.Buck,Pro-Tem
MikeFreeman,Chair
ScottK.James
KevinD.Ross
LoriSaine
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KarlaFord

From: LoriSaine
Sent: Tuesday,July25,202310:51AM
To: KarlaFord
Subject: RE:PleaseReply-P/ACityofGreeleyAmendedIGA-59thAve&OStRAB

yes

LoriSaine

WeldCountyCommissioner,District3
1150OStreet
POBox758
GreeleyCO80632
Phone:970-400-4205
Fax:970-336-7233
Email:Isaine@weldgov.com
Website:www.co.weld.co.us

InGodWeTrust

ConfidentialityNotice:Thiselectronictransmissionandanyattacheddocumentsorotherwritingsareintendedonlyfor
thepersonorentitytowhichitisaddressedandmaycontaininformationthatisprivileged,confidentialorotherwise
protectedfromdisclosure.Ifyouhavereceivedthiscommunicationinerror,pleaseimmediatelynotifysenderbyreturn
e-mailanddestroythecommunication.Anydisclosure,copying,distributionorthetakingofanyactionconcerningthe
contentsofthiscommunicationoranyattachmentsbyanyoneotherthanthenamedrecipientisstrictlyprohibited.

From:KarlaFord<kford@weld.gov>
Sent:Tuesday,July25,202310:44AM
To:LoriSaine<lsaine@weld.gov>
Subject:PleaseReply-P/ACityofGreeleyAmendedIGA-59thAve&OStRAB
Importance:High

Pleaseadviseifyouapproverecommendation.Thankyou.

KarlaFordA
OfficeManager,BoardofWeldCountyCommissioners
1150OStreet,P.O.Box758,Greeley,Colorado80632
::970.336-7204::kford(weldqov.com::www.weldqov.com::
**PleasenotemyworkinghoursareMonday-Thursday7:00a.m.-5:00p.m.**
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AMENDMENTTOINTERGOVERNMENTALAGREEMENT
FORCONSTRUCTIONOFIMPROVEMENTS

TO"O"STREET&59thAVENUEINTERSECTION

ThisAMENDMENTTOINTERGOVERNMENTALAGREEMENTFOR
CONSTRUCTIONOFIMPROVEMENTSTO"O"STREET& 9thAVE E
INTERSECTION("IGAAmendment")isenteredintothisdayof ,
202$,betweentheCityofGreeley,Colorado,ahomerulemumcipalityoftheStofColorado,
whoseaddressis100010thStreet,Greeley,Colorado80631("GREELEY"),antheCountyof
Weld,StateofColorado,byandthroughtheBoardofCountyCommissionersoftheCountyof
Weld,Colorado,whoseaddressisPOBox758,1150"O"Street,Greeley,Colorado80632
("WELDCOUNTY")

WHEREAS,GREELEYandWELDCOUNTYenteredintotheattached
IntergovernmentalAgreementforConstructionofImprovementsto"O"Street&59thAvenue
Intersection("OriginalIGA"),fullyexecutedandeffectiveAugust25,2021,and,

WHEREAS,thepartieswishtocontmuetoworkonthesubjectPROJECTuntilits
completion,and

WHEREAS,GREELEYANDWELDCOUNTYalsodesiretoexpandtheProjectscope
ofworktoincludearoutmemillandoverlayofWeldCountyRoad(WCR)31,alsoknownas
5982AvenueinGREELEY,fromthehmitsoftheseintersectionimprovementsnorthtoState
Highway(SH)392("theWCR3IMillandOverlay)

NOW,THEREFORE,FORCONSIDERATION,THEADEQUACYOFWHICHIS
ACKNOWLEDGED,THEPARTIESAGREEASFOLLOWS

A TherecitedamountGREELEYhasbudgetedtooffsetitsportionofthecostsofthe
constructionoftheimprovementsisincreasedfrom$5,212,000to$7,245,017,and

B Paragraph2oftheOriginalIGAisherebydeletedmitsentiretyandreplacedasfollows

2PROJECTSubjecttothetermscontainedmtheOriginalIGA,GREELEYplansto
undertakeandcompletethePROJECTnolaterthanDecember31,2024,however,if
thePROJECTisnotcompletedbyDecember31,2025,GREELEYshallreimburse
WELDCOUNTYforanyamountcontributedtothePROJECTtothatdate

C Paragraph4oftheOriginalIGAisherebydeletedmitsentiretyandreplacedasfollows

4CONTRIBUTIONBYWELDCOUNTYWELDCOUNTYagrees,uponreceipt
ofanmvoice,afterthePROJECThasbeenbidandawardedtoacontractor,topayto
GREELEYthesumof$1,669,565in2024toassistwithconstruction,inspection,and
oversightofthePROJECTInaddition,WELDCOUNTYANDGREELEYagreeto
sharefifty-fifty(50/50)thecostsassociatedwiththeWCR31MillandOverlay,which
willbeincludedwiththePROJECTbid

D Paragraph11oftheOriginalIGAisherebydeletedinitsentiretyandreplacedasfollows
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11NOTICESAllnoticesrequiredhereinshallbemailedviaFirstClassMailtothe
parties'representativesattheaddressessetforthbelow

GREELEY WELDCOUNTY
BhooshanKarnik ElizabethRelford
DeputyPWDirector/ChiefEngineerDeputyPWDirector
2835W 10thStreet 1150"O"Street
Greeley,CO80631 Greeley,CO80632

D ALLOTHERTERMSOFTHEORIGINALIGAREMAININFULLFORCEAND
EFFECT

[Remainderofpageintentionallyleftblank,signaturepagetofollow]
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INWITNESSWilEREOF,thepartieshaveexecutedthisAmendedIGAinduplicateon
thedatewrittenabove.

GREELEY:

APPROVEDASTOSUBSTANCE:
DocuSignedby:

CityManager
APPROVEDASTOAVAILABILITYOFFUNDS:
DocuSignedby:

FDAAOCOMARRad9. .. ..
DirectorofFinance

APPROVEDASTOLEGALFORM:
DocuSignedby:

CityAttorney
WELDCOUNTY:

ATTEST: , BOARDOFCOUNTYCOMMISSIONERS
WELDC UNYClerktoheBoard WELDCOUNTY,COLORADO

By: By:
(Deputy)rktthe MikeFreeman,Chair

11 AUG162023
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Citrof/

Greele

DOCUMENTROUTINGMEMORANDUM
Thepurposeofthismemorandumistoprovideinformationregardingtheattached
documentroutedtoyouforyoursignature.
TO:

{SelectRecipientsBelow-SeeSignatureAuthorityRequirements}
DougMarek,CityAttorney:LegalServices@greeleygov.com
TammyHitchens,InterimFinanceDirector:Tammy.Hitchens@greeleygov.com
RaymondC.LeeIII,CityManager:Val.Scheffer@greeleygov.com
JohnGates,Mayor:viaCityClerk@greeleygov.com
HeidiLeatherwood,CityClerk(Attest):Heidi.Leatherwood@greeleygov.com

FROM:
ONBEHALFOF(Ifapplicable):

Initialsofabove:__(Mustbefirstinsigningorder)
RE:Resolution15,2023-AmendmenttoIntergovernmentalAgreementwithWeldCounty
ExecutiveSummary:
ARESOLUTIONOFTHECITYOFGREELEYCITYCOUNCILAUTHORIZINGTHE
CITYTOENTERINTOANAMENDMENTTOTHEINTERGOVERNMENTAL
AGREEMENTWITHWELDCOUNTYFORTHECONSTRUCTIONOF
IMPROVEMENTSTO"O"STREETAND59THAVENUEINTERSECTION.
INCREASEFROM$5,212,000TO$7,245,017.

TimeSensitivity?Ifyes,deadlinedate andreason:

LegalReview:
IsthisastandardcontractasdefinedbyCityCodeSection2-184(a)(2)? YesNo N/A
Ifthisisnotastandardcontract.andhasnotbeenreviewedbyCAO,thisdocumentmaynotberoutedforsignatures.PleasesubmitforLegalReviewonCOGIpriortorouting.
Ifthisisnotastandardcontract,whichattorneyreviewedthedocument?
Name:
ObtainedApprovals,Reviews,orRecommendations(Ifapplicable)
oCityCouncil oBoardorCommissionOther
Ord./Res.#: (specify)
Date: Date: Date:
ContractAmount: (ifapplicable)

62123
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THECITYOFGREELEY,COLORADO

RESOLUTION15,2023

ARESOLUTIONOFTHECITYOFGREELEYCITYCOUNCILAUTHORIZINGTHE
CITYTOENTERINTOANAMENDMENTTOTHEINTERGOVERNMENTAL
AGREEMENTWITHWELD COUNTYFOR THE CONSTRUCTIONOF
IMPROVEMENTSTO"O"STREETAND59™AVENUEINTERSECTION

WHEREAS,maccordancewithCRS§29-1-203,governmentsmaycooperateorcontractwith
oneanothertoprovideanyfunction,service,orfacilitylawfullyauthorizedtoeachofthe
cooperatmgorcontractingunits,

WHEREAS,theCityandWeldCountycurrentlyshareoperationalmamtenanceandjurisdiction
ofthemtersectionof59*Avenueand"O"Street,

WHEREAS,theCityCouncilauthorizedtheCitytoenterintoanIntergovernmentalAgreement
withWeldCountyfortheConstructionofImprovementstothe"O"Streetand596Avenue
IntersectionviaResolution25,2021,and

WHEREAS,thepartiesexecutedtheIntergovernmentalAgreementonAugust3,2021,and

WHEREAS,thepartiesnowdeemitnecessarytoamendtheIntergovernmentalAgreementto
extendthetimeframeforcompletionofthemtersectionimprovements,todocumenttheincreased
amounttheCityhasbudgetedfortheproject,andtomemorializetheparties'agreementtosplit
thecostofMillandOverlay,and

WHEREAS,itismthebestmterestsofthecitizensoftheCitytoamendtheIntergovernmental
Agreementsothattheprojectcancontinue

NOW,THEREFORE,BEITRESOLVEDBYTHECITYCOUNCILOFTHECITYOF
GREELEY,COLORADO:

Section1TheCityCouncilherebyauthonzestheCitytoexecutetheAmendmenttothe
IntergovernmentalAgreementforConstructionofImprovementsto"O"Street&59*Avenue
Intersection,acopyofwhichisattachedheretoandmcorporatedheremasExhibitA

Section2 CitystaffisherebyauthorizedtomakechangesandmodificationstotheAmendment,
solongasthesubstanceoftheAmendmentandtheorigmalIntergovernmentalAgreementremains
unchanged
Section3 ThisResolutionshallbecomeeffectiveimmediatelyuponitspassage,asprovidedby
theGreeleyCharter
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PASSEDANDADOPTED,SIGNEDANDAPPROVEDTHIS16thDAYOFMY,2023.

ATTEST: THECITYOFGREELEY,COLORADO
* *

By:
CityClerk May
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NewContractRequest

Entityinformation

EntityName* EntityID* NewEntity?
CITYOFGREELEY @O0001551

ContractName* ContractID ParentContractID
CITYOFGREELEYIGA-OSTREET&59THAVERAB 7319
ContractStatus ContractLead* RequiresBoardApproval
CTBREVIEW ERELFORD YE5

ContractLeadEmail DepartmentProject#
erelford@co.weld.co.us

ContractDescription*
INTERGOVERNMENTALAGREEMENTTOPAY$1,669,565TOTHECITYOFGREELEYFORTHECONSTRUCTIONOFA
ROUNDABOUT(RAB)ATTHEINTERSECTIONOFOSTREET(CR64)AND59THAVE(CR31)ANDAMILLANDOVERLAYCOST
SHAREOF50/50FROMTHEPROJECTLIMITSTOSH392.
ContractDescription2
CITYOFGREELEYRECElVEDSTBGFUNDINGFROMTHENFRMPOTOASSISTWITHCONSTRUCTIONCO5T5.

ContractType* Department RequestedBOCCAgendaDueDate
AGREEMENT PUBLICWORKS Date* 08/12/2023

0816/2023Amount* DepartmentEmail
$1,669,565.00CM- WillaworksessionwithBOCCberequired7*
Renewable* PublicWorks@weldgov.comNO
NO DepartrnentHeadEmailDoesContractrequirePurchasingDept.tobeincluded?

CM-PublicWorks-AutomaticRend DeptHead@weldgov.com

Grant CountyAttorney
GENERALCOUNTY
ATTORNEYEMAIL

IGA
YES CountyAttorneyEmail

CM-
COUNTYATTORNEY@WELDG
OV.COM
IGADeadlineDate

IfthisisarenewalenterpreviousContractID

ifthisispartofaMSAenterMSAContractID

Note:thePreviousContractNumberandMasterServicesAgreementNumbershouldbeleftblankifthosecontractsarenotin
onBase



ContractDates

EffectiveDate ReviewDate* RenewalDate
0816/2024

TerminationNoticePeriod .CommittedDeliveryDate ExpirationDate*
08162024

ContactInformation

ContactInfo
ContactName ContactType ContactEmail ContactPhone1 ContactPhone2

Purchasing

PurchasingApprover PurchasingApprovedDate

ApprovalProcess

DepartmentHead FinanceApprover LegalCounsel
.CURTISHALL CHERYLPATTELLi BRUCEBARKER

DHApprovedDate FinanceApprovedDate LegalCounselApprovedDate
08/14/2023 0815/2023 08152023

FinalApproval

BOCCApproved TylerRef#
AG081623

BOCCSignedDate

BOCCAgendaDate
0816/2023

Originator
ERELFORD


